IFB #22.0004 COPY and SPECIALTY PAPER

Bid Summary
Angi Enterprises LLC Paper Express In

ITEM# |Mill BRAND ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE BASIS |PAPER|COLOR MIN MIN QTY/CTN uom PRICE MILL BRAND Vendor Notes PRICE MiILL BRAND

WEIGHT |GRADE BRIGHTNESS | OPACITY PER UOM |UNLESS BID| UNLESS BID PER UOM |UNLESS BID| UNLESS BID

SPECIFIED | SPECIFIED SPECIFIED | SPECIFIED
Item #1 |Any Any Copy/Laser 8.5"x11" |20 Bond White |90 90 5,000/CTN Carton | $ 65.31 UNIVERSAL $ 3355 Norpac Natural Choice
5,000/CTN
ltem #2 |Any Any Copy/Laser 8.5"x11" |20 Bond  |White |90 90 40CTN/PLT  |Pallet | $1,930.27 UNIVERSAL $1,342.00 Norpac Natural Choice
Item #3 |Any Any Recycled Copy/Laser 8.5"x11" |20 Bond  |White |90 90 5,000/CTN _ [Carton | $§ 68.85 UNIVERSAL $ 3355 Norpac Natural Choice
ltem #4 |Any Any 3 Hole Copy/Laser 8.5"x11" |20 Bond White {90 90 5,000/CTN Carton | § 78.84 UNIVERSAL $ 36.50 | Performance [ Leading Edge
ltem #5 [Any Any Copy/Laser 8.5"x14" |20 Bond White {90 90 5,000/CTN Carton | $ 93.23 UNIVERSAL $ 48.20 | Performance [ Leading Edge
ltem #6 [Any Any Copy/Laser 11"x17" |20 Bond White {90 90 2,500/CTN Carton | $ 78.84 UNIVERSAL $ 37.70 | Performance [ Leading Edge
2,500/CTN

Iltem #7 |Any Any Copy/Laser 11"x17" |20 Bond White |90 90 40CTN/PLT  [Pallet $2,804.60 UNIVERSAL $1,508.00 | Performance | Leading Edge
Item #8 |Any Any Copy/Laser 8.5"x11" |20 Bond Colors [90 90 5,000/CTN Carton | $ 83.61 UNIVERSAL $ 55.50 Domtar Colors
Iltem#9 |Any Any Copy/Laser 8.5"x14" |20 Bond Colors [90 90 5,000/CTN Carton No Bid $ 76.30 Domtar Colors
Item #10 |Any Any Copy/Laser 11"x17" |20 Bond Colors [90 90 2,500/CTN Carton No Bid $ 59.95 Domtar Colors
Item #11 |Any Any Uncoated Text 8.5"x11" |60 Book White 5,000/CTN Carton | § 170.13 DOMTAR $ 42.60 | Performance | Leading Edge
Item #12 |Any Any Uncoated Text 11"x17" 60 Book White 2,500/CTN Carton | $§ 143.69 INTERNATIONAL PAPER $ 46.75 | Performance | Leading Edge
Item #13 |Any Any Index 8.5"x11" |110 Index  [White 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 148.86 NEENAH PAPER $ 57.50 Domtar Index
Item #14 |Any Any Index 11"x17"  [110 Index  [White 1,000/CTN Carton | § 142.65 NEENAH PAPER $ 60.20 Domtar Index
Item #15 |Any Any Index 8.5"x11" |110 Index Colors 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 125.00 NEENAH PAPER $ 60.20 Domtar Index
Item #16 |Any Any Index 11"x17" |110 Index |Colors 1,000/CTN Carton No Bid $ -
Item #17 |Any Any Vellum Bristol 8.5"x11" |67 VB White 2,000/CTN _|Carton | $ 75.10 DOMTAR $ 4240 Domtar VB
Item #18 |Any Any Vellum Bristol 11"x17"_[67 VB White 1,000/CTN__|Carton | $§ 95.36 NEENAH PAPER $ 4440 Domtar VB
Item #19 |Any Any Vellum Bristol 8.5"x 11" |67 VB Colors 2,000/CTN Carton | $ 69.40 SPRINGHILL $ 44.40 Domtar VB
Item #20 |Any Any Vellum Bristol 11"x17" |67 VB Colors 1,000/CTN Carton No Bid $ 46.30 Domtar VB
Item #21 |Neenah |Astrobright Smooth Text 8.5"x11" [60 Text Colors 5,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 79.50 X X
Item #22 |Neenah |Astrobright Smooth Text 11"x17" |60 Text Colors 2,500/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 82.40 X X
Item #23 |Neenah |Astrobright Smooth Cover 8.5"x11" [65 Cover [Colors 2,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 64.10 X X
Item #24 |Neenah |Astrobright Smooth Cover 11"x17" |65 Cover [Colors 1,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 66.40 X X
Item #25 |Any Any Digital opague colors 8.5"x11" |70 Text Colors 4,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 59.60 X X
Item #26 |Any Any Digital opague colors 11"x17" |70 Text Colors 2,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 6230 X X
Item #27 |Any Any Digital Vellum Bristol Cover 8.5"x11" |67 VB Colors 2,000/CTN Carton | $ 92.55 X X $ 44.40 X X
Item #28 |Any Any Digital Vellum Bristol Cover 11"x17" 67 VB Colors 1,000/CTN Carton X X No Bid $ 46.35 X X
Item #29 |Any Any Digital index 8.5"x11" |90 Index  [White 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 100.37 X X $ 48.10 X X
Item #30 |Any Any Digital index 11"x17"  [90 Index  [White 1,000/CTN Carton | $ 92.83 X X $ 50.30 X X
Item #31 |Any Any Digital index 8.5"x11" |90 Index Colors 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 103.41 X X $ 50.30 X X
Item #32 |Any Any Digital index 8.5"x11" |110 Index  [White 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 104.97 X X $ 57.50 X X
Item #33 |Any Any Digital index 11"x17"  [110 Index  [White 1,000/CTN Carton | $§ 102.67 X X $ 60.20 X X
Item #34 |Any Any Digital index 8.5"x11" |110 Index Colors 2,000/CTN Carton | $§ 136.80 X X $ 60.20 X X
Item #35 |IP Hammermill |Radiant white Laser Print 8.5"x11"_[24 text white 5000/CTN __ |Carton | § 169.20 X X $ - X X
Item #36 |IP Hammermill |Radiant white Laser Print 8.5"x14" (24 text white 5000/CTN __ |Carton | § 225.00 X X $ - X X
Item #37 |IP Hammermill |Radiant white Laser Print 11"x17"_[24 text white 2500/CTN __ |Carton | § 188.88 X X $ - X X
Item #38 |IP Hammermill |Radiant white Laser Print 8.5"x11" [32 text white 4000/CTN __|Carton | $ 187.83 X X $ - X X
Item #39 |IP Hammermill |Radiant white Laser Print 11"x17"_[32 text white 2000/CTN _ |Carton | § 124.95 X X $ - X X
Item #40 |IP Hammermill | Color copy digital 8.5"x11"_[80 cover _|white 2000/CTN _ |Carton | § 158.42 X X $ - X X
ltem #41 |IP Hammermill | Color copy digital 11"x17"_[80 cover _|white 1000/CTN__|Carton X X No Bid $ - X X
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ITEM # |Mill BRAND ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE BASIS | PAPER|COLOR MIN MIN QTY/CTN Uom PRICE MILL BRAND Vendor Notes PRICE MILL BRAND
WEIGHT |GRADE BRIGHTNESS [ OPACITY PER UOM (UNLESS BID| UNLESS BID PER UOM |UNLESS BID| UNLESS BID
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Item #42 [any any Gloss photo paper 24" 8 mil gloss  |white 1 roll No Bid $ -
Item #43 [any any Gloss photo paper 36" 8 mil gloss  [white 1 roll $ 177.63 8.5 mil CANON USA $ -
Item #44 [any any Gloss photo paper 42" 8 mil gloss  |white 1 roll No Bid $ -
Item #45 [any any Uncoated text 24" 20 bond white 1 roll No Bid $ -
Item #46 [any any Uncoated text 30" 20 bond white 1 roll No Bid $ -
ltem #47 [any any Uncoated text 36" 20 bond white 1 roll No Bid $ =
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